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1 Introduction

This note gives an extensive overview of the format and information contained in
the files that will be available for download to bidders during the 3G and BWA
auctions in India. It should be read in conjunction with the user manual for
DotEcon’s electronic auction system, WebBidder (the EAS manual).

During each of these auctions, there will be a number of data files available for
download through the electronic auction system:

* ‘Round data’ files, which contain current information about Round
Prices and (where applicable) the Bidder’s Provisional Winning Bids;

* ‘Auction history’ files, which contain, for each completed round and
each service area Aggregate Demand information, Round Prices
and (where applicable) the Bidder’s Provisional Winning Bids at the
start and at the end of the Round; and

* ‘Decision summary’ files, which contain aggregate information on the
Bidder's own Bids across all service areas for all completed rounds.

This document sets out: when during the auction these files will be available and
updated, how to download them, a description of the file types, the fields that
each of these files will include and the format of outputs populating these fields.

Sample files corresponding to those described in this document are available for
download from the DoT website. All data files will be in tab-separated value
format with Windows-style line breaks. It should be possible to open these in a
text editor, spreadsheet or database programme.

2 ‘Round data’ file

Information contained in the ‘Round data’ file

‘Round data’ files containing information on the current round will be available
from the EAS when the current round is scheduled until the round closes. If one
or more Bidders go into extension, the ‘Round data’ file will still be available
during the extension period. This file can be used to obtain a summary of Round
Prices by service area and to identify where Bidders may need to make further
bids. Thereafter, this information can be obtained from the auction history.

To download the status and value of its bids at the start of a particular completed
Clock Round, a Bidder can click on the ‘Round data’ link on the control panel. A
window will then appear asking whether the file should be opened or saved.
Bidders should choose the preferred option and click “OK”.

DotEcon Ltd e 17 Welbeck Street, London W1G 9XJ ¢ www.dotecon.com



Auction of 3G and BWA Spectrum

If a bidder chooses to save the file, the resulting downloaded file will be of the
form ‘RoundData_X.tsv’ where X is the number of the Clock Round for which
data on the status and value of the Bidder’s bids are included.

The downloadable ‘Round data’ file will consist of a file with:
* asingle header row describing the field; and

* arow for each service area containing tab-separated values for each
field.

A list of these fields and the format of the output in each case is displayed in
Table 1 below:

Table 1: List of fields and forms of output in 'Round data’ files

Field Form of output

Service Area Name of the service area

Round Price (Rs Crore) Number with up to two decimal places, e.g.
193.64, 30.7

Provisional Winning Price at Number with up to two decimal places, e.g.

start of round (Rs Crore) 193.64, 30.7

Provisional Winning Bid ‘yes’ or ‘no’

held at start of round
Provisional Winning Bid at If ‘Provisional Winning Bid held’ is ‘yes’:
start of round (Rs Crore) Number with up to two decimal places, e.g.
193.64, 30.7
If ‘Provisional Winning Bid held’ is ‘no’:
‘nfa’ (not applicable)
Provisional Winning Bid If ‘Provisional Winning Bid held’ is ‘yes’:
ranking at start of round Number
If ‘Provisional Winning Bid held’ is ‘no’:
‘nfa’ (not applicable)
Provisional Winning Bid at If ‘Provisional Winning Bid held’ is ‘yes’:
start of round equal to ‘yes’ or ‘no’
Round Price If ‘Provisional Winning Bid held’ is ‘no’:
‘n/a’ (not applicable)

For the first Clock Round

The ‘Round data’ file for the first Clock Round becomes available after the
Auctioneer has scheduled the first round and will be available to the Bidder until
the end of the round. If one or more Bidders go into extension, the ‘Round data’
file will still be available during the extension period. The ‘Round data’ file for the
first Clock Round will not be available after the end of the first round. The ‘Round
data’ file for the second Clock Round will then be made available as soon as the
Auctioneer has scheduled the second Clock Round. An illustration of the
contents of a ‘Round data’ file that will be available for download during the first
Clock Round is provided in Figure 1 of the Annex.

For all other Clock Rounds

The ‘Round data’ file for a Clock Round becomes available after the Auctioneer
has scheduled the first round and will be available to the Bidder until the end of
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the round. If one or more Bidders go into extension, the ‘Round data’ file will still
be available during the extension period. The ‘Round data’ file for a Clock Round
will not be available after the end of the round. The ‘Round data’ file for the next
Clock Round will then be made available as soon as the Auctioneer has
scheduled the next Clock Round. An illustration of the contents of a ‘Round data’
file that will be available for download during Clock Round 4 is provided in Figure
2 of the Annex. In contrast to the ‘Auction history’ and ‘Decision summary’ files,
the data for a new round is not appended to the data of a previous round. The
‘Round data’ file only contains information for the current (or currently scheduled)
Clock Round.

3 ‘Auction history’ file

Information contained in the ‘Auction history’ file

‘Auction history’ files including data relating to the most recent completed Clock
Round will be available from when the round is closed and the round results have
been approved by the Auctioneer.

To download the ‘Auction history’ file including the information for the most
recently completed Clock Round, a Bidder can click on the ‘Auction history’ link
on the control panel. A window will then appear asking whether the file should be
opened or saved. Bidders should choose the preferred option and click “OK”.

If a Bidder chooses to save the file, the resulting downloaded file will be of the
form ‘AuctionHistory_X.tsv’ where X is the number of the most recent Clock
Round for which auction data are included.

The downloadable ‘Auction history’ file will consist of a file with:
* asingle header row describing the field; and

* arow for each service area containing tab-separated values for each
field.

A list of these fields and the format of the output in each case is displayed in
Table 2 below:

Table 2: List of fields and forms of output in 'Auction history' files

Field Form of output

Round Number

Service Area Name of Service Area

Round Price (Rs Crore) Number with up to two decimal places, e.g.
193.64, 30.7

Bids received in round Number e.g. 5, 2

Aggregate Demand at Number e.g. 6, 4

Round Price

Excess Demand at Round Number e.g. 2, -1
Price
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Field

Form of output

Provisional Winning Price
at start of round (Rs Crore)

Provisional Winning Bid
held at start of round

Provisional Winning Bid at
start of round (Rs Crore)

Provisional Winning Bid
ranking at start of round

Provisional Winning Bid at
start of round equal to
Round Price

Decision

Provisional Winning Price
at end of round (Rs Crore)

Provisional Winning Bid
held at end of round

Provisional Winning Bid at
end of round (Rs Crore)

Provisional Winning Bid
ranking at end of round

Provisional Winning Bid at
end of round equal to next
Round Price (if applicable)

For the first Clock Round

Number with up to two decimal places, e.g.
193.64, 30.7.
If there is no Provisional Winner:

‘yes’ or ‘no’

If ‘Provisional Winning Bid held’ is ‘yes’:
Number with up to two decimal places, e.g.
193.64, 30.7

If ‘Provisional Winning Bid held’ is ‘no’:
‘n/a’ (not applicable)

If ‘Provisional Winning Bid held’ is ‘yes’:
Number

If ‘Provisional Winning Bid held’ is ‘no’:
‘n/a’ (not applicable)

If ‘Provisional Winning Bid held’ is ‘yes’:
‘yes’ or ‘no’

If ‘Provisional Winning Bid held’ is ‘no’:
‘n/a’ (not applicable)

‘Bid’ OR ‘No bid’

Number with up to two decimal places, e.g.
193.64, 30.7

‘yes’ or ‘no’

If ‘Provisional Winning Bid held’ is ‘yes’:
Number with up to two decimal places, e.g.
193.64, 30.7

If ‘Provisional Winning Bid held’ is ‘no’:
‘n/a’ (not applicable)

If ‘Provisional Winning Bid held’ is ‘yes’:
Number

If ‘Provisional Winning Bid held’ is ‘no’:
‘n/a’ (not applicable)

If ‘Provisional Winning Bid held’ is ‘yes’:
‘yes’ or ‘no’

If ‘Provisional Winning Bid held’ is ‘no’:
‘n/a’ (not applicable)

After the results of the first Clock Round have been announced and until the
results of the second Clock Round are announced, the Bidder may download the
‘Auction history’ file for the first round. An illustration of the contents of an
‘Auction history’ file that will be available for download after the first round is
provided in Figure 3 of the Annex.
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For all other Clock Rounds

The auction history for a particular Clock Round after round 1 becomes available
after the Auctioneer has approved the results of this round. The ‘Auction history’
file will remain the same until the Auctioneer has approved the results of the next
Clock Round (e.g. the ‘Auction history’ file that becomes available after the
results of round 3 are approved will be available until the Auctioneer approves
the results of round 4). An illustration of the contents of an ‘Auction history’ file
that will be available for download after round 3 is provided in Figure 4 of the
Annex. The history of subsequent rounds is appended to the data from previous
rounds. Hence, during a round a Bidder will be able to download the relevant
information for all previous rounds.

4 ‘Decision summary’ file

Information contained in the ‘Decision summary’ file

‘Decision summary’ files including data relating to the most recent completed
Clock Round will be available from when the Clock Round is closed and the
round results have been approved by the Auctioneer.

To download data on its bids for all completed Clock Rounds, a Bidder can click
on the ‘Decision summary’ link on the control panel. A window will then appear
asking whether the file should be opened or saved. Bidders should choose the
preferred option and click ‘OK’.

If a Bidder chooses to save the file, the resulting downloaded file will be of the
form ‘DecisionSummary_X.tsv’ where X is the number of the most recent Clock
Round for which data on the Bidder’'s Clock Round bids are included.

The downloadable ‘Decision summary’ file consist of:
* asingle header row describing the fields

* arow for each completed round containing tab-separated values for
each field.

A list of these fields and the format of the output in each case is displayed in
Table 3 below:

Table 3: List of fields and forms of output in 'Decision summary' files

Field Form of output
Round Number
Action ‘Decision submitted’ OR

‘No decision submitted’

Extension Budget used in EITHER ‘None’ OR

round Number between 1 and 6 ‘x 10 minutes’
(corresponding to the number of 10-minute
extension periods used so far)
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Field Form of output

Extension Budget carried Number between 0 and 24 ‘x 10 minutes’

forward (corresponding to the number of 10-minute
extension periods still available for subsequent
rounds)

Eligibility Points at start of ~ Number

round

Activity Requirement (%) 80 or 90 or 100

Activity required to Number

preserve eligibility

Activity in round Number

Activity associated with Number

Service Areas in which you
were a Provisional Winning
Bidder at start of round

Activity associated with Number
New Bids

Eligibility Points carried Number
forward

Total value of bids placed = Number with two decimal places, e.g. 18,783.71,
in round plus unchanged 30,356.00
Provisional Winning Bids

(Rs Crore)
Total value of Provisional Number with two decimal places, e.g. 18,783.71,
Winning Bids at end of 30,356.00

round (Rs Crore)

For the first Clock Round

After the results of the first Clock Round have been announced and until the
results of the second Clock Round are announced, the Bidder may download the
‘Decision summary’ file for the first round. An illustration of the contents of a
‘Decision summary’ file that will be available for download after the first Clock
Round is shown in Figure 5 of the Annex.

For all other Clock Rounds

The Decision summary file for a particular Clock Round after the first Clock
Round becomes available once the Auctioneer has approved the results of this
Clock Round. The information in the Decision summary file will be updated to
include a subsequent round as soon as the Auctioneer has approved the results
of this subsequent round. An illustration of the contents of a ‘Decision summary’
file that will be available for download after round 3 is shown in Figure 6 of the
Annex.

The decision summary for subsequent rounds is appended to the data from
previous rounds. Hence, during a round a Bidder will be able to download the
relevant information for all previous rounds.
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Annex A: Example of downloadable files

Figure 1: Example of a ‘Round data’ file available for round 1

Provisienal Winning  Provisienal Winning Provisional Winning  Provisional Winning | Provisional Winning Bid

Reund Price {Rs Price at start of Bid held at start of Bid at start of Bid ranking at start at start of round equal
Service Area Crore} round (Rs Crore) round reund (Rs Crore) of round to Round Price
Dalbi 320 (- no nfa nfa n/a
Murmbai 320 - i fi/a n/a n/a
Kolkata 120 - ne n/a n/a n/a
Maharashtra 320 - ne n/a n/a n/a
Gujarat 320 (- no n/a nfa nfa
Andhra Pradesh 320 - ne n/a n/a n/a
Karnataka 320 |- no n/a nfa n/a
Tamil Nadu 320 - i fi/a n/a n/a
Kerala 120 - i fi/a n/a fn/a
Purjab 120 - ne n/a n/a n/a
Haryana 120 (- no n/a nfa nfa
Uttar Pradesh
(E} 120 - ne n/a n/a n/a
Uttar Pradesh
(W) 120 - no n/a n/a n/a
Rajasthan 120 - i fi/a n/a nfa
Madhya
Pradesh 120 (- no nfa nfa n/a
West Bangal 120 - i fi/a n/a n/a
Himachal
Pradesh 30 - ne n/a n/a n/a
Bihar 30 - no n/a nfa nfa
Orissa 30 - i fi/a n/a nfa
Assam 30 - ne n/a n/a n/a
Morth East 30 - no n/a nfa n/a
Jarnmu and
Kashmir 30 - i fi/a n/a nfa
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Figure 2: Example of a ‘Round data’ file available for round 4

Service Area
Delki
Mumbai
Kalkata
Maharashtra
Gujarat
Andhira
Pradesh
Karnataka
Tamil Nadu
Kerala
Punjab
Haryana
Uttar Pradesh
(E}

Uttar Pradesh
(W)
Rajasthan
Madhya
Pradesh
West Bengal
Himachal
Pradesh
Bihar

Orissa
Accam

Morth East
Jammu and
Kashrmir
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Round Price

[Rs Crore)
3139 36
356.32
138.91
342,75
336.43

329.69
326.43
356.32
138.91
123.63
133.62

133.62

123.63
123.63

123.63
123.63

30.6
30.9
30.9
30.9
30.9

30

Provisional Winning
Price at start of
round (Rs Crore)
336
339.36
132.3
339.36
323.2

326.43
323.2
i52.8
132.3

122.41
132.3

132.3

122.41
122.41

122.41
122.41

30.3
30.6
30.6
30.6
30.6

30

Provisional
Winning Bid held
at start of round
Yes

o

ne

Yes

o

no
o
yEs
no
WS
o

no

no
no

yes
WS

yes
WS
yEs
no
o

no

Provisional Winning  Prowvisional Winning

Bid at start of
round (Rs Crore)

r/a
nya

r/a

nya
r/a

nya
ny/a
r/a

nya
r/a

nya
r/a

339,36
r/a
ny/a
r/a

nfa
r/a

nfa
nya
r/a

nfa
r/a

339.36

3528

122.41

122.41
122.41

0.6
30.6
0.6
nfa
r/a

Bid ranking at start
of round

2

Lad s

Provisional Winning

Bid at start of round
equal to Round Price
yes

r/a

ny'a

i3]

r/a

&
r/a
o
&
e

ny'a
r/a

&
r/a

Mo
mno

yes
e
o
&
r/a
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Figure 3: Example of an ‘Auction history’ file available for round 1
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Aggregate
Round Price | Bids received Demand at
Round Service Area  (Rs Crore) in round Round Price
1 Delhi 320 5 5
1 Mumbai 320 5 5
1 Kolkata 120 5 5
1 Maharashtra 320 5 5
1 Gujarat 320 4 4
Andhra
1 Pradesh 320 4 4
1 Karnataka 320 4 4
1 Tamil Nadu 320 5 5
1 Kerala 120 5 5
1 Punjab 120 5 5
1 Haryana 120 5 5
Uttar
1 Pradesh (E) 120 5 5
Uttar
1 Pradesh (W) 120 4 4
1 Rajasthan 120 3 3
Madhya
1 Pradesh 120 3 3
1 West Bengal 120 4 4
Himachal
1 Pradesh 30 4 4
1 Bihar 30 4 4
1 Orissa 30 4 4
1 Assam 30 3 3
1 Morth East 30 4 4
Jammu and
1 kashmir 30 3 3

Excess

Demand at

Round Price
2

I

oo - M

~o~oo

Provisional
Winning Price at
start of round (Rs
Crore)

Provisional
Winning Bid
held at start of
round

no

no

no

no

no

no
no
no
no
ne
ne

ne

ne
ne

ne
no

no
no
no
no
no

no

Provisional
Winning Bid at
start of round (Rs
Crore)

Provisional
‘Winning Bid
ranking at start of
round

Provisienal Winning
Bid at start of
reund equal to
Round Price

Provisional

Winning Price at
end of round (Rs

Decision  Crore)

Bid
Bid
No bid

No bid
No bid

320
320
120
320
320

320
320
320
120
120
120

120

120
120

120
120

Provisional

Winning Bid
held at end
of round

Provisional

Winning Bid at
end of round

(Rs Crore)
nja

120

30
30

Provisional
Winning Bid
ranking at
end of round

Previsienal Winning

Bid at end of round

equal to next Round

Price (if applicable)
a
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Figure 4: Example of an

‘Auction history’ file available for round 3
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Figure 5: Example of a ‘Decision summary’ file available for round 1

Activity
associated with
Service Areas in
which you were 2
Activity required Provisiona Activity

Total value of bids
placed in round Total value of
plus unchanged Provisional

Provisional Winning Bids at
Extension Budget Extension Budget Eligibility Points at Activity to preserve Winning Bidder at assoclated with Eligibility Points Winning Bids (Rs end of round {(Rs
Round Action used in round carried forward start of round Requirement (%) eligibility Activity in round  start of round Mew Bids carried forward Crore} Crore)
Decision
1 submitted None 24 % 10 minutes 350 B0 280 308 o 308 350 3080 180

March 2010



Auction of 3G and BWA Spectrum 12

Figure 6: Example of a ‘Decision summary’ file available for round 3

Activity
associated with Total value of bids

Service Areas in placed in round Total value of

which you were 2 plus unchanged Provisional
Activity required Provisional Activity

Provisional ‘Winning Bids at
Extension Budget Extension Budget Eligibility Points at Activity to preserve Winning Bidder at assoclated with Eligibility Points Winning Bids (Rs end of round {(Rs
Round Actian used in round carried forward start of round Requirement (%) eligibility Activity in round  start of round New Bids carried forward Crore} Crore)

Decision

1 submitted None 24 % 10 minutes 350 B0 280 308 o 308 350 3080 180
Decision

2 submitted None 24 % 10 minutes 350 B0 280 1a7 18 165 233 1933.5 303
Decision

3 submitted 1 x 10 minutes 23 x 10 minutes 233 100 233 233 30 203 233 2471.63 1450.55
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